BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Madison Comséy, Mississippi

E-911 Administration Office 146 W. Center Street, Room 203, PO Box 608, Canton, MS 39046
T: (601) 859-6485 F: (601) 859-4743

DATE: January 22, 2015
TO: Madison County Board of Supervisors
FROM: Butch Hammack 9‘
Emergency Management Odtice
RE: Road Claim
Jeramey Thompson
Virlillia Rd.

After further investigation on the above referenced claim, it is the recommendation of the

Emergency Management Office to approve and pay the claim to the order of Jeramey
Thompson in the amount of $991.96 for stated repairs. If any further information is needed,
please contact our office.

Reported area was not repaired within the 7 day period allotted per Madison County Road
Claim Policy.
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A ROAD CLAIM INCIDENT REPORT
In order to process the claim, please print & fill out completely and return to Madison Co. EMA office along
with two signed estimates for damages being claimed. All required paperwork must be returned within.
7 days of incident. NOTE: Our policy is a reimbursement policy. We DO NOT freplace nor arrange to have
any repairs made. It is to your 0wn:'discfetidn to when the repairs are made, If your claim is approved a
reimbursement check will mailed to you at the given address givenbelow. %
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Jan. 9. 2015 3:34PM

555 SUNNYBROOK RDD.
RIDGELAND, MS. 39157
601-957-3400 _
www.pattypeckhonda.com

THE PARTS STAFF AT
PATTY PECK HONDA
THANKS YOU FOR YOUR BUS|NESSI
PLEASE CALL US FOR ALL YOUR
HONDA PARTS AND SERVICE NEEDS.

39786
601-937-1022

CASH OWEN ALLEY

JERAMEY THOMPSON
154 MILLHOUSE DR
MADISON, MS 39110-6966
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42700-T2A-A83  DISK (18X

CORE PRICE

50.00

No. 6706 P. 1

01/09/15

100.00

DISCLAIMER OF WARRANTIES :

ANY WARHANTIES ON THE PRODUCT SOLD HEHEBY ARE THOSE FADE BY THE
MANUFAGTURER, THE SELLER HEREGY EXPRESSLY DISCLAIMS ALL WARRBANTIES,
EITHER EXPRESS OR. IMPLIED. INCLUDING ANY IMPLIED WARRANTY OF
MERGHANTABILITY OR FITNESS FOR A FARTICULAR PIJRPOSE, AND THE SELLER
NEITHER A5SUMES NOK AUTHORIZES ANY OTHER PERSON TO ASSUME FOR Y
ANY LIABILITY IN CONNEGTION WITH THE SALE OF SAID PRQDUCTS. ANY
LIMITATION CONTAINED HEREIN DOES NOT APPLY WIMERE PROHIBITED BY LAW,

SUBTOTAL

RESTOCK CHARGE
TAX

NO RRETURNS ON ELECTRICAL OR SFEGIAL ORDER PARTS. NO CREDIT AFTER 30
DAYS. OR WITHOUT INVOICE. 15% RESTOCKING CHARGE, PRICES MAY CHANGE

FREIGHT
WITHQUT NOTICE,

BAV THIS AMOUNY

1106.14

0.00
77.43

0.00
1183.57

16:38:42 CUSTOMER COPY * PRICE QUOTE ** NET505
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JAN 9, 2015 COUNTER SALES store 01 PARTSOL 380/5039 2525

.-—_._.__.__-_-——.——-.....-......,.—_.__.___.....-..-___.___........-___.__.....--..-____.4-__—__.___.4---_.__....--

X INVOICE# PQ31
1  CODE,COMMENTS

BOR BOYTE HONDA
2188 HIGHWAY 18

2  SALE TYPE/? R BRAMDON, MS 39042
3 PAY METHOD/? PENDING T#
4  ORDER DATE 01/09/2015
5 REQUIRED DATE 01/09/2015
6 CUST PO#
7  SHIP TO/? JERAMEY THOMPSON

154 MILLHOUSR DR

MADISON,MS 39110

_ FX 601-499-3303

X  TOTAL TAX. EXT. 991.96 TOTAL EXTENDED,
g SALES TAX 69.44 TA¥X CODES
9 MISC 0.00

10 FREIGHT AMOUNT

11 SHIP VIA

12 RESTOCK CHG. 0.00
X  TOTAL INVOICE 1061.40
(S=SAVE) (CR=CONS REACH) (P=PRINT) (O=PURCHASE ORDER) (IC=INVOICE COMMENTS)
INVALID ENTRY :

co°d BANOH 3LA0F S@:9T STOC-60-NUL



JAN 9, 2015 COUNTER SALES Store 01 PARTSO01 380/5039 2525

_.__.._..__._.__._____.___-....-__.___.___..__,.,..._...._____._.....-__..__...___-..-_.-..__-.....--_——-——.-—---—-——

INVOICE# CuUsT # NAME PHONE - PAY CTR# PL

PQ31 1029 °  COUNTER SALE COUNTER PENDING 627 99

LN# PART# / DESCRIPTION . QORD QSHP SALE CORE EXTENDED TC PL
1 42700-T2A-A82 DISK (18X 2 445,98 50,00 991.96 99

AVAT LIST COMP : ASB0C

BN TRADE . STS SRC COMPNT

BN2 COST GRP ALTER GP%

NEWH# ' OLD# ,

REMARKS ‘ TOTAL 991.96

0B BOYTE HONDA

0188 HIGHWAY 18
BRANDON, MS 39042

10°d ) BANCOH 3LA0d SP:9T STB2-60-NOL
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Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Monday, January 12, 2015 10:22 AM
To: Helen Keller; 'Shirley Brown'
Subject: Road Claim

We received a road claim on Virillia Road. Landmarked between Old Yazoo and Patrick Road. Direction of
travel is NE. The date of completion would be January 19% Please let me know of any status changes.

Jennlifer Carpenter
Administrative Assistant
Madison County Board of Supervisors
E-911 Administration
0: 601-855-5620
C: 601-259-2260



Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Wednesday, January 21, 2015 9:21 AM
To: Helen Keller; 'Shirley Brown' -
Subject: Road CLaim Follow ups

I have three road claims I am need to follow up and close out. Oije I called emailed and called about last
week on Davis Crossing. The other is on Yandell Rd. and the last one is Virillia Rd. Can you tell me if any
repairs have been made on these three, please.

_Jennlifer Carpenter

Administrative Assistant

Madison County Board of Supervisors
E-911 Administration

0: 601-855-5620

C: 601-259-2260




Jan. 21, 2015 9:45AM Madison Cty Road Mgt Dept

:
i

. 1/21/2015

To

Company: E911 OFFICE
Department:  JENNIFER TAYLOR

Name:

T —

From

Company: MADISON COUNTY

Department: ROAD DEPARTMENT

Name: HELEN KELLER
Phone: 601-855-5673
FAX: 601-859-5857

VIRLILIA ROAD REPAIRS FOR 12/28/14 THROUGH 1/21/15
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Jennifer Taylor

From: Jennifer Taylor

Sent: Thursday, January 22, 2015 8:30 AM
To: Helen Keller

Subject: Virillia Rd.

Good Morning! You sent me labor sheets for Virillia Rd. Michael went out there yesterday and the potholes

in area we reported (between Movie Town Ln. and Old Yazoo City Rd.) have not been repaired. I wanted to
let you know.

_Jennifer Carpenter
Administrative Assistant
Madison County Board of Supervisors
E-911 Administration
0: 601-855-5620
C: 601-259-2260



